
February 5, 2022


Ladies and gentlemen, 


      I am writing to submit my testimony for the 
hearing on the extension of Governor Lamont’s 
emergency powers related to the pandemic.

      It is far past time for this to end! COVID 19 has 
never been isolated, therefore doesn’t really exist. It 
has been admitted by the FDA that the PCR tests 
were never set on detecting COVID, instead were 
set to discover the flu. These testing tools were 
ineffective. They caused a hysteria. The masks that 
were forced on everyone, have also proven to be 
ineffective and useless. These were mostly harmful 
to our children on a few fronts. The COVID 19 virus 
was hyped to scare people into submission. It is 
being made more clear to the public that the death 
numbers have been manipulated to entice people to 
vaccinate. All other types of deaths have been 
marked as COVID, so that medical facilities can 
collect incentives for doing so. “ Get the vaccine 
“ they said. “Get the booster” they said. “Get the 
second, get the third” they said. When will it stop! 
These vaccines do not prevent you from getting or 
transmitting COVID. Why are we continuing to push 



more shots? This is like the old adage of the 
definition of insanity: continue to do the same thing 
expecting a different result! This is all for a virus that 
is over 99% survivable. In all, the price for all this 
nonsense has been too high. Loss of jobs, 
businesses, school closures, increased suicides, 
diminishing social skills of our children, the loss of 
two years of continuous and uninterrupted quality 
education of these kids has been far to great, for 
something that was only supposed to be,” two 
weeks to flatten the curve!” We’ve had our state 
damaged enough by this farce! I emplore you to 
vote NO on the extension of emergency powers. I 
ask you to follow the lead of other states. Have the 
courage to be leaders and do what is right and end 
the Godforsaken mandates and COVID policies. 
Thank you for your time.


Respectfully,


John W Taylor
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